SEP 1.4 2015

| REQUEST FOR AG | ENDA PLACEMENT FORM |
|---|--|
| | uesday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates |
| SUBMITTED BY: Ralph McBro TODAY'S DATE: September 4, 2 | 1 |
| <u>DEPARTMENT</u> : Purchasing | |
| SIGNATURE OF DEPARTMEN | <u>T HEAD</u> : |
| REQUESTED AGENDA DATE: | September 14, 2015 |
| SPECIFIC AGENDA WORDING 418 Road Materials with multiple vo PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM | |
| SUPPORT MATERIAL: See atta | achment |
| TIME: 5 min | ACTION ITEM: X WORKSHOP: CONSENT: EXECUTIVE: |
| STAFF NOTICE: | |
| COUNTY ATTORNEY: AUDITOR: PERSONNEL: BUDGET COORDINATOR: | IT DEPARTMENT: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS: OTHER: |
| *********This Section to be Co | mpleted by County Judge's Office******** |
| | ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE: |
| REQUEST RECEIVED | D BY COUNTY JUDGE'S OFFICE |
| COURT MEMBER APPROVAL | Date |
| | |

Ralph McBroom, CPM
Purchasing Agent
ramcbroom@johnsoncountuix.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

APAC-Texas Inc. PO Box 224048 Dallas, TX 75222

RE:

RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. McConathy,

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Raiph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

| Yes, I wish to renew: Stul MCS | Date: 9-2-2015 |
|--------------------------------|----------------|
| No, I do not want to renew: | Date: |

Ralph McBroom, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramchroom@johnsoncountutx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytwarg

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Arnold Crushed Stone, Inc. PO Box 632 Blum, TX 76627

RE: RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Arnold,

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Raiph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

| Yes, I wish to renew: | ira Cirule Date: 9315 | |
|-----------------------------|-----------------------|--|
| No, I do not want to renew: | Date: | |

Ralph McBroom, CPM.
Purchasing Agent
ramcbroom@ichnsoncountutx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

APAC-Texas Inc. PO Box 224048 Dailas, TX 75222

RE:

RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. McConathy,

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Raiph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

| Yes, I wish to renew: _ | Styl Mich | Date: 9-2-2015 | |
|-------------------------|-----------|----------------|--|
| No, I do not want to re | • • • | Date: | |

Ralph McBroom, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramchroom@johnsoncountytx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Arnold Crushed Stone, Inc. PO Box 632 Blum, TX 76627

RE: RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Arnold,

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Ralph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

| Yes, I wish to renew: | 14 Cruca Date: 9/3/15 |
|-----------------------------|-----------------------|
| No, I do not want to renew: | Date: |

Justin Scharnhorst Assistant Purchasing



1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B

Cleburne, Texas 76051

(817)556-6382

Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Fort Worth Crushed Stone

PO Box 121906

Fort Worth, TX 76121

RE: RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Brown,

| The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices. |
|---|
| Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible. |
| Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter. |
| Sincerely, |
| Ralph McBroom C.P.M. |
| Johnson County Purchasing Agent |
| Yes, I wish to renew: $4 \pi d \mathcal{W}$. 2π Date: $9 - 3 - 15$ |

No, I do not want to renew: ______ Date: _____

Ralph McBroom, CP.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramchroom@iohnsoncountytx.org



Justin Schernhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jschernhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Ingram Concrete, LLC 4989 N FM 199 Cleburne, TX 76033

RE:

RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Hammond,

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to <u>pur@johnsoncountytx.org</u> as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Ralph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

| Yes, I wish to renew: Lam James ! | Date: | 9-4-15 |
|-----------------------------------|-------|--------|
| No, I do not want to renew: | Date: | |

Ralph McBroom, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramcbroom@johnsoncountytx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Martin Marietta 1503 LBJ Freeway Ste.400 Dallas, TX 75234

RE: RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Foley

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Ralph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

Ralph McBroom, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramchroom@johnsoncountutx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Rattler Rock PO Box 10 Blum, TX 76627

RE:

RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Davis

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@iohnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Raiph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

Ralph McBroom, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramcbroom@johnsoncountutx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Squaw Creek Materials PO Box 123 Rainbow, TX 76077

RE: RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Mr. Gosdin

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Ralph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

Yes, I wish to renew: Date: 9/2/2015

No, I do not want to renew: Date:

Ralph McBroom, CPM.
Purchasing Agent
ramcbroom@johnsoncountytx.org



Justin Scharnhorst
Assistant Purchasing Agent
jscharnhorst@johnsoncountytx.org

1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051 (817)556-6382 Fax(817)556-6385

September 2, 2015

Trinity Materials 401 I-45 South Ferris, TX 75125

RE: RFP # 2014-418 Road Materials

Donna Chappell

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to pur@johnsoncountytx.org as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Ralph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent

Ralph McBroom, C.P.M.
Purchasing Agent
ramcbroom@johnsoncountytx
.org



1102 E. Kilpatrick, Suite B Cleburne, Texas 76051

Fax

September 2, 2015

Vulcan Materials Co. 6100 Western Place Dr., Ste 400 Fort Worth, TX 76107

RE:

RFP # 2014-417 Road Materials

Mr. Boyd,

The contract for Road Materials will expire on September 30, 2015. Johnson County is interested in renewing with your company for another year at the contracted prices.

Please consider this request to renew. Please call if you have any questions. I would ask that you sign below and fax or email to as soon as possible.

Thank you for your time and consideration in handling this matter.

Sincerely,

Ralph McBroom C.P.M.
Johnson County Purchasing Agent



SEP 14 2015

RFB 2014-418: Road Materials

| Vendor | > | Vendor | Vendor | dor | | Ver | Vendor | | Ver | Vendor | Vei | Vendor | | Ver | Vendor | Vendor | |
|----------------------|---|---|---|------------------------|-----------|---|---|--------------|--------------------------|---|------------------|-------------|-----------|------------------------------|---------------------------|-------------------|-----------|
| old Crushed Stone | | Apac-Texas Inc | Vulcan Materials | laterials | | Martin | Martin Marietta | | Rattle | Rattler Rock | Squav | Squaw Creek | | Ingram P | Ingram Materials | Trinity Materials | als |
| Delivered | | Delivered | Pick Up | Freight | Delivered | Pick up | Freight | Delivered | Pick Up | Delivered Pick Up | Pick Up | Freight | Delivered | Pick Up | Delivered | Pick up | Delivered |
| No Bid | | * | \$85.00 | \$0.25 | \$85.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | Chico \$75.00 | * | \$85.00 | \$0.25 | \$85.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | - 25 | * | \$75.00 | \$0.33 | \$75.33 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | - | * | \$75.00 | \$0.33 | \$75.33 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | \$15.00 Chico | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$18.00 | \$0.25 | \$18.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | \$6.50 1/4 Torpedo gravel | * | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | \$8.50 | \$0.25 | \$8.75 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | - | No Bid | \$18.00 | \$0.25 | \$18.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$8.50 | \$0.25 | \$8.75 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | \$16.00 Weatherford | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | \$12.00 | * | \$8.00 | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | \$8.00 | \$0.25 | \$8.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | \$7.00 | \$0.25 | \$7.25 | \$21.00 | * | \$15.00 | No Bid |
| No Bid | a No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | \$110.00 Midlothian | \$0.40 | \$110.40 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | a No Bid | No Bid | \$7.50 | \$0.25 | \$7.75 | \$8.00 Chico | No Bid | | \$5.25 | No Bid | \$6.50 Type A | \$0.25 | \$6.75 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | \$7.50 | \$0.25 | \$7.75 | \$8.00 Chico | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | \$6.50 Type A | \$0.25 | \$6.75 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | \$45.00 | \$0.25 | \$45.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | d No Bid | No Bid | \$45.00 | \$0.25 | \$45.25 | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| No Bid | Chico \$95.00 d Alvarado \$110.00 | * | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | : | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| 23 Tons | 23 Tons for delivery | No Min on FOB | Manufactured sand for crushed limestone | ed sand for mestone | | 25 1 | 25 Tons | . | Also have a 3 rock \$ | Also have a 3"-5" over size rock \$6.25-T | 24 1 | 24 Tons | | | *Call for current rate | 24 Tons | |
| | *1-10 Miles \$0.30 a ton | *1-10 Miles \$5.00 per ton, add \$0.30 a ton for each additional mile | | | | \$300.00/Loac bar is desire deliv | \$300.00/Load if a spreader bar is desired on cement deliveries | | i | | | - | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | 1 | | | Ţ | V | | | | | . September . | |